RESOLUTION 12-2012-125
AWARDING BID FOR SOLID WASTE DISPOSAL SERVICES AND
AUTHORIZING THE EXECUTION OF CONTRACT
FOR THE BOROUGH OF BARRINGTON

WHEREAS, the County of Camden, as the Lead Agency for the Camden County Cooperative Pricing
System, System Identifier # 57-CCCPS (Cooperative), received and opened bids at its Division of
Purchasing on August 2, 2012 at 11:00 A.M., Prevailing Time, for Bid A-25 for Disposal of Solid Waste
for Camden County, various Camden County Agencies and various Camden County Municipalities
under the Camden County Cooperative Pricing System, System Identifier # 57-CCCPS, the receipt of
which bids were duly advertised in accordance with law; and

WHEREAS, four bids were received;

Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LLC
BFI Transfer Systems of Pa.

Covanta 4Recovery

Republic Services of NJ, LLC; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Chosen Freeholders awarded a contract to the lowest responsible
bidder, Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP, 600 Morgan Boulevard, Camden, NJ 08104
for (Option 1) as listed on the schedule attached hereto for the services required for the needs of the
County of Camden and other Cooperative Purchasing Members; and

WHEREAS the term of agreement shall commence on or about September 1, 2012 through
December 31, 2014 with the pricing as indicated on the schedule below, with a single one-year option
to renew at the sole discretion of the County; and

WHEREAS, Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP has extended pricing to both
Camden County and to the members of the Camden County Cooperative Pricing System as set forth
in the bid specifications; and

WHEREAS, the Borough of Barrington is a participant in the Camden County Cooperative
Pricing System and this bid; and

WHEREAS, it has been determined that bid option #1 for Disposal Services of approximately
“2,353 Tons Annually" provides for the best benefit to the Borough of Barrington; and

WHEREAS, the bids have been evaluated by the Borough Superintendent of Public Works and
Purchasing Agent, and the recommendation is made as herein after provided to the lowest



responsible bidder to comply with the uniform bid specifications, Camden County Energy Recovery
Associates, LP; and

WHEREAS, bid option #1 provides for an initial base period cost of $59.00 per ton beginning
September 1, 2012 and ending on December 31, 2012; the cost of $61.00 per ton for the period of
January 1, 2013 through December 31, 2013; and the cost of $63.00 per ton for the period of January
1, 2014 through December 31, 2014; and

WHEREAS, the Borough of Barrington will participate in any subsequent extension years as
provided in the bid specifications; and

WHEREAS, upon adoption, a copy of this approving Resolution shall be transmitted to Camden
County Energy Recovery Associates, LP, in order to effectuate formal notice of Barrington’s intention
to exercise its option for the initial term of this bid; and

WHEREAS, the Borough of Barrington CFO will certify that sufficient, available and legally
appropriated funds for this expenditure are available.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the County of Camden as follows:

1. The provisions of the WHEREAS clauses set forth above are incorporated herein by reference and
made a part hereof.

2. The Bid and Contract for Solid Waste Disposal is hereby awarded, subject to the necessary funds
being appropriated by the governing body for all fiscal years to Camden County Energy Recovery
Associates, LP, for a term of twenty-eight months, commencing on September 1, 2012 and
terminating on December 31, 2014, for the disposal prices as indicated herein.

3. The of Borough of Barrington in the County of Camden, does hereby authorize the proper officials
to execute and award a contract to Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP for the term
stated herein, in a form to be approved by the Solicitor of the Borough of Barrington.

4. A copy of this Resolution shall be forwarded to Camden County Energy Recovery Associates, LP at:
600 Morgan Boulevard, Camden, New Jersey 08104, and Perryville Corporate Park, Clinton, New
Jersey 08809-4000.



OPTION 1 - ENTIRE CAMDEN COUNTY COOPERATIVE PRICING GROUP

VENDOR YEAR 1 YEAR 2 YEAR3 YEAR4 (PERTON PRICING)

Camden County Energy

Recovery Associates, LLC $59.00 $61.00 $63.00 $76.00
*BF| Transfer Systems of Pa. $63.00 $63.00 S64.74 $66.53
*Covanta 4Recovery $63.00 S64.16 $65.34 $66.55
Republic Services of NJ, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*Qut of state facility: additional cost per ton is reflected in per ton pricing.
Year 1 term: September 1, 2012 through December 31, 2012
Options:

Year 4 term year to be exercised in the sole discretion of the County

Adopted: December 18, 2012

Mayor Municipal Clerk



